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On February 1st and 2nd we will be 
collecting donations for our Souper 
Bowl of Caring, these funds will go 
directly to local soup kitchens.  We will 
need your help after all Mass times. 
 
On February 6th we will be hosting our 
High School Coffee House from 8:00-
9:30PM.  Come and share faith and 
friendship We will have coffee and hot 
chocolate and snacks. 
 
On February 7th and 8th and 9th we 
will be attending our annual Mt. 2000 
retreat at Mt. St. Mary’s in 
Emmitsburg.  Please pray for us during 
this time so that we may deepen our 
faith and love of our Lord. 
 
On February 14th we will join our 
Parish for a Holy Hour of adoration.  
We will meet in the Church at 4:30PM 
and attend the hour until 5:30 and then 
travel to the Parish Center for some 
pizza and fun with hearts.  We will 
finish up at 6:30PM. 
 
On February 17th we will travel to the 
Glen Burnie Outdoor Stating Arena for 
some winter fun.  We will be leaving 
from the Church parking lot at 4:00 and 
skate from 5-7PM.  The cost for the 
skating is $8.00 and that will include 
skates,  we will stop for a snack 
afterwards if you would like to bring 
some cash for that.  Please let us know 
by February 14th if you plan to join us 
 
On February 24th we will be traveling 
to Annapolis for our Md. March for Life.  
We will leave at 3:45 and return home 
around 10:00, this year we have a bus, a 
free will offering will be collected to 
help with the cost.  Please help us 
support the unborn.  Please RSVP to us 
by February 21st. 
 
If you have any questions, please  give 
us a call. 
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